
Free Life
Assurance!

(See over for details)

This offer is...
 -  for all
 -  forever
 -  available now
 -  for a limited time

Daily Sowers
C.P. 536 St-Hugues Qc Canada J0H 1N0

Free Life Assurance

Hurry; for this offer, like you,
could expire at any moment!

Receive the assurance of eternal life,
free - all premiums paid by the Lord
Jesus on the cross! The Bible says God
so loved the world that He gave His
only begotten Son that whosoever
believes in Him should not perish but
have everlasting life (John 3:16).  It
also says that if one does not believe,
the wrath of God abides on him (John
3:36). Don't stay under God's wrath
any longer but receive the Lord Jesus
as your personal Saviour. Do not
neglect this wonderful offer of eternal
salvation; admit you are guilty of sin
and accept by faith that, on the cross,
the Son of God received the punishment
you deserved. You will then have peace
with God and the assurance that you
have eternal life, if you believe on the
Name of the Son of God (1 John 5:13).
Do you have this assurance?
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